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Minutes of Regular Meeting: June 18, 2007

:30pm Meeting called to order by Gary Britten
4r. Britten will run the meeting due to Mr. LaHote having a voice problem)

:

ledge of Allegiance

oil Call: Trustee Britten, Trustee LaHote, Administrator Hrosko, Chief
Stribmy, Chief Dimick, Deputy Chief Brice, Maintenance Supervisor Gottfried,
Zoning Inspector Gam and Recreation Director Warnimont. Trustee Mack and
Fiscal Officer Haar were absent.

LHote made a motion (seconded by Britten) to approve the minutes of the May
2 , 2007 Department Head Meeting and the taped minutes of that meeting.
B itten and LaHote Yes, Mack Absent Motion Approved

L ote made a motion (seconded by Britten) to approve the minutes of the June 4,
07 Regular Meeting and the taped minutes of that meeting.

Bitten and LaHote Yes, Mack Absent Motion Approved

L Hote made a motion (seconded by Britten) to approve the minutes of the June
1 , 2007 Department Head Meeting and the taped minutes of that meeting.
B itten and LaHote Yes, Mack Absent Motion Approved

L ote made a motion (seconded by Britten) to approve the amended agenda.
1

Bi tten and LaHote Yes, Mack Absent Motion Approved

5pm Road Bid Opening — Hrosko read the road bids as follows:

Thompson Rd. "J" Street Glen Eagles l s Street
G ddis Paving $156,698.65 $57,547.80 $31,158.10 $26,134.10
C estline 182,630.30 72,030.40 39,278.90 35,775.80
S elly Co. No bid No Bid 40,869.28 No Bid
G rken 136,781.25 86,827.50* 30,469.65 *Combined

with "J" St.
bid

wers 152,273.00 55,658.50 28,709.50 25,749.00
BOrgman No Bid 62,008.50 34,047.88 28,074.00

B" tten made a motion (seconded by LaHote) to accept the bids as read. Britten
LaHote Yes, Mack Absent Motion Approved

7:15 Perrysburg Heights - Anita Serda told the Trustees she was doing a follow up
o a letter the Heights Association sent the Township asking for $5,000.00 in
s pport for the next year. Ms. Serda talked about the operating expenses the

f ights Association has in conjunction with the property, buildings and programs.
S ome examples she gave were Building maintenance and repairs are annually in
the $3,000.00 area, the cleaning of the center is $13,000.00 (that is done by two
residents who bid out the work), Columbia gas is at $11,000.00, Toledo Edison is
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4412,000.00, water & sewer is at $2,000.00 and general supplies arert $2,000.00
= e.
	 geLsom

endowment later next year. When asked how the gym is, Ms. Serda replied
fabulous. She said attendance has gone from about 32 kids a day to 68 kids per
day. In the summer they have gotten involved with the Feed The Children
Program, who provides free hot meals for any child from age 4 to age 18 if they
want to come to the center every day. Britten asked if anyone in the audience had
any questions for Ms. Serda. Hearing none, Britten said his feelings were that we
should wait until the next regular meeting when a full board is present to make a
decision. Britten stated that last year the Township gave them $3,000.00 but it was
understandable why they needed the increase this year. Ms. Serda said she
understood and would come back the next meeting. Ms. Serda also said she
wanted to mention that on August 10th & 1 1 th they are having their annual fund
raising "South of their Border" event.

8:15 Set Tentative 2008 Budget Hrosko talked about the process used to put
together the budget. LaHote made a motion (seconded by Britten) to approve the
tentative 2008 budget. Britten and LaHote Yes Mack Absent Motion
Approved
Britten made a motion (seconded by LaHote) to set the public hearing date of July
2, 2007 @ 7:45 for the tentative 2008 budget. Britten and LaHote Yes, Mack
Absent Motion Approved

Maintenance: Kraig Gottfried — No Report

Police: Chief Stribrny gave the April 2007 calls for service report (copy in file).
Stribrny asked to increase five office PO's as follows: PO 2007-001 by $500.00,
PO# 2007-002 by $200.00, P0#2007-003 by $600.00, P0#2007-004 by $1,800.00,
PO#2007-005 by $500.00. Britten made a motion (seconded by LaHote) to
approve the increase in the blanket POs mentioned. Britten and LaHote Yes,
Mack Absent Motion Approved
Stribrny asked for approval for a PO for Affidavit Maker for their yearly license
agreement and fee in the amount of $600.00, for End to End Inc. for their yearly
maintenance agreement and fee in the amount of $3,900.00 and for the Verizon
maintenance agreement for the Police/Fire /EMS 911 system yearly fee in the
amount of $3,489.24. Britten made a motion (seconded by LaHote) to approve the
three yearly contracts as stated by the chief Britten and LaHote Yes, Mack
Absent Motion Approved

Fire: Chief Dimick — no report

EMS: Deputy Chief Brice gave the run report (copy in file).
Brice asked the Trustees permission to get 2 diesel filters for the two busiest pieces
of equipment, which would be the first out Life Squad and the first out Fire
Engine. The cost would be $17,948.00 for both (Fire Department and the EMS
department would pay $8, 974.00 each). Brice said we have applied for a grant for
additional filters but it is no guarantee we will receive the grant. Britten made a
motion (seconded by LaHote) to approve this request. Britten and LaHote Yes,
Mack Absent Motion Approved
Brice asked the Trustees to approve the renewal of the annual Ram Support
Contract (this program handles all the EMS billing) at a cost of $1,625.00 (same as
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t). Britten made a motion (seconded by LaHote) to approve this rewest.
	proved

ce said the final thing he has is the purchase of the three AED's to replace the
IS's current one, which will then go in the Police cruisers, and the purchase of a
new AED for a Police cruiser. This has been a long drawn out quest by Brice.
-± in December of 2006, the AEDs were ordered from Medtronic Physio
ntrol, who because of some issues they are having are not able to deliver them.
ce has to spend the $7,000.00 grant monies given the Township by the end of
Le or we lose them. .Brice said he has been talking to Philips and his
ommendation is to go ahead and purchase the 4 AEDs from Phillips at a cost of
916.96 and they can ship tomorrow. Brice asked for a PO made out to Philips in
amount of $9,000.00 and to close the PO to Medtronic Physio Control. Britten
de a motion (seconded by LaHote) to approve the purchase of the AEDs in the
ount of $9,916.96. Britten and LaHote Yes, Mack Absent Motion Approved

creation: Bob Warnimont — no report

Ring: Grant Gam said Mr. Moore who owns the nuisance garage on Rived road
is at the meeting tonight and has asked to speak. Garn turned over the floor to Mr.

Ty Moore.

wrence Moore of 30661 East River Rd_ addressed the Trustees and told them
th t no one has lived at the property for a long time due to an ongoing sewer
pr iblem. When he purchased the first property in the summer, he discovered the
n ighbors had septic tanks on his side of the road. The people on the other side of
the road from the river had tied their septic tanks into the drainage for the regular
water run off. Then he found out the two buildings next to him were under orders
fr m the Wood County Health Department to stop dumping raw sewage to two
s tic tanks that weren't septic tanks at all and went into the river. Everything
came down to a big storm sewer that was on Bates Rd. At the time he approached
th Trustees and was told they could do nothing. Mr. Moore went to court in
C lumbus and they refused to bring down a blanket order saying they could not
crinue to do theses practices. Mr. Moore then moved his stuff back to
Clifomia and for 10 years he just kept the grass mowed and such. Then the two
ai+rtment buildings came up for sale and he bought them. He shut down the
sewage and asked the tenants to leave. Two tenants did not leave and winter was
se ting in and Mr. Moore wanted to return to California, so he shut off their
u lities. One move out after about three weeks but the other stayed on for two
m nths. Mr. Moore went back to California and during the winter his house was

ned down. The Police had a suspect, who was a former tenant in the apartment
lding but could not arrest him. Mr. Moore would occasionally see him on the

property and call the Police but he would always manage to get away. Then one of
tI4 apartment building burned down. So now everything is just setting there and he
was still fighting the sewer problems. In 2001 he received a notice that they were a
sewer line up Bates to River Rd. and south to the sub-division. In 2003 they got to

point of being by his house and Mr. Moore got in negations with Northwest
water and Sewer. Mr. Moore said that they pushed everyone to tie into the sewer,
bt.it he refused and is still not tied into the sewer. Consequently Mr. Moore was

4::1 for Municipal Court for 32,000.00.
At this point Gary Britten told Mr. Moore he was going to stop him and said "We
ha I our hearing on this a month ago or better and I guess I let you come to the
podium to tell us what you are going to do with your property. I don't really care
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month (June). Mr. Moore then will remove the old foundation and plans to build
on the same site. Britten then asked him about the other building on the property.
Mr_ Moore said he is planning to renovate that one. Garn said Mr. Skaff sent Mr.
Moore a letter giving Mr. Moore until the 29th of June to have the barn (garage)
torn down. According to Mr. Moore's own statements he will have it down by
then. Garn said no letter has been sent on the house as of yet and this issue will
have to be closely monitored to ensure the barn (garage) is torn down the house is
remediated. Britten said he had a problem because Mr. Moore did not show up at
the hearing when notified to inform the board of his intentions. The board then
voted to tear down both structures. Britten said "Now we are starting to tread
water and I don't understand why we did this then. Is this what we are going to do
on every single one of these? If we vote to do this, then we need to do it or we
might as well put that nuisance thing in the shredder." Garn said we need to revisi
the issue on the house. The house structure issue will be revisited in July or early
August. If the barn (garage) is not torn down by the end of June, the Township wil
have it torn down. Mr. Moore said he wants to get the property taken care of
including having the sewer run to the house.
Garn said Mr. Black on Roachton Rd. is still waiting for the insurance company to
settle with him. The company has settled on the house portion but not the contents
and Mr. Black will receive no money from them until the entire claim is settled.
When it is he will begin work immediately.
Garn said he has been talking to Mr. Pines with the property on Apex Lane. Mr.
Pines contacted Trailer Trash to try to take care of the mobile home and is asking
for more time as his 30 days are up. Britten said it is time to get it out of there.
Garn said he will talk to our maintenance dept and also get prices for removal.

Office: Shirley Haar — absent Hrosko had the Trustees sign the PO report and th
Check report.
Hrosko told the Trustees he had a request to move 440,000.00 into the EMS fund
from the general fund. This was monies already in the 2007 budget. LaHote made
a motion (seconded by Britten) to approve this transfer. Britten and LaHote Yes
Mack Absent Motion Approved
Hrosko asked for approval of a PO for Goodrenjiont's (on the copier) maintenanc
contract in the amount of $818.10. LaHote made a motion (seconded by Britten) t
approve this PO request Mack Absent Motion Approved

Administrator: John Hrosko asked the trustees to approve buying a block of time
from Computol. It is less expensive to purchase a time block than to pay them by
the hour. LaHote made a motion (seconded by Britten) to purchase a 15 hour bloc
of time from Computol at a 15% saving. Britten and LaHote Yes Mack Absent
Motion Approved

Britten asked for Public Comments. Hearing none, Britten asked for a motion to g
into executive session.

8:15pm LaHote made a motion (seconded by Britten) to adjourn into executive
session for pending or imminent litigation.
Britten and LaHote Yes, Mack Absent Motion Approved
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ifgallote made a motion (seconded by Britten) to adjourn out of executive
ion.

14 LaHote made a motion (seconded by Britten) to adjourn.

Sh

Gary ritten — Vice Chairman

- Chairman
vw

Craig LaHot
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